
Ponyfinder: Flights of Honor - Pegasi of
Everglow

The pegasi of Everglow are a majestic and enigmatic breed of winged
horses that soar through the skies of the Ponyfinder campaign setting.
Their shimmering coats and ethereal wings have made them a popular
subject of legend and lore, and they are often sought after by adventurers
and collectors alike.

Appearance

Pegasi of Everglow are typically large, standing around 15 hands high at
the shoulder. Their coats are a vibrant golden color, with iridescent feathers
that shimmer in the light. Their wings are long and graceful, with a
wingspan of up to 20 feet. Their eyes are a piercing blue, and they have a
long, flowing mane and tail.
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While most pegasi of Everglow are golden in color, there are rare instances
of other color variations. These include silver, white, and even black. These
variations are often associated with different elemental affinities or magical
abilities.

Abilities

Pegasi of Everglow are not only beautiful creatures, but they are also
powerful and agile. They are capable of flying at great speeds, and they
can carry a rider or a pack of up to 500 pounds. They are also skilled in
combat, and their hooves and wings can be used to deliver powerful blows.

In addition to their physical abilities, pegasi of Everglow also possess a
number of magical abilities. They can cast the feather fall spell at will,
which allows them to descend slowly to the ground without taking damage.
They can also use their wings to create a gust of wind, which can be used
to knock down opponents or create a distraction.
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Habitat

Pegasi of Everglow are found in the Everglow Forest, a vast and ancient
woodland located in the heart of the Ponyfinder campaign setting. The
forest is home to a variety of other creatures, including unicorns, faeries,
and centaurs.

Pegasi of Everglow are social creatures, and they live in small herds of up
to 20 individuals. They are also territorial, and they will defend their territory
from intruders.

Diet

Pegasi of Everglow are herbivores, and their diet consists mainly of
grasses and leaves. They also enjoy eating fruits and vegetables.

Reproduction

Pegasi of Everglow reach sexual maturity at around 5 years of age. They
mate for life, and they typically give birth to a single foal every 2 years.
Foals are born with their wings folded against their backs, and they do not
learn to fly until they are around 6 months old.

Uses

Pegasi of Everglow are highly prized by adventurers and collectors. They
are often used as mounts, and they can also be used to transport goods or
to deliver messages.

Pegasi of Everglow are also popular subjects of art and literature. They
have been featured in countless paintings, sculptures, and stories.



The pegasi of Everglow are a truly magical breed of creature. Their beauty,
power, and intelligence make them a popular choice for adventurers and
collectors alike. If you are ever fortunate enough to encounter one of these
majestic creatures, be sure to treat it with respect.
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